Town Council Meeting Minutes
Page 17
February 6, 2018

	 TOWN COUNCIL

MEETING MINUTES

february 6, 2018


[image: image1.png]O\NN OF Lo
THOMPSONG s o, eo
2z

INC.
1799




CALL TO ORDER.  The Chairman, Councilor Ward, called the meeting to order and led the pledge of allegiance to the flag at 7:00 PM.
ROLL CALL.  Members present were Councilors Ward, Albert, Kolbe, Lunt, Crawford, and Larochelle.  
VOTE (2018-15A) Councilor Crawford, seconded by Councilor Albert moved to excuse Councilor Brunelle’s absence. Order passed - Vote 6-0.
Also present were Diane Barnes, Town Manager; Dennis Douglass, CEO; Ryan Leighton, Public Works Director; Marc Hagan, Police Chief; Tracey Steuber, Economic Development Director; Mark Stevens, Parks & Recreation Director; Karen Paradis, Planning Board Member; Scott Hall, Planning Board Member; Miriam Morgan-Alexander Morgan; and approximately 25 citizens in the audience.
good news & recognition
The Town Council acknowledged Lisbon’s Greyhound Cheerleaders who successfully took the regional championship.  They will go to the State’s final next week.  
PUBLIC HEARING
A. Public meeting to hear public comments
on lisbon emergency – level of service/funding
Dorothy Fitzgerald said she was in favor of keeping the same level of service from Lisbon Emergency. She said they respond in a timely manner and are very professional.  She asked if the Council had contacted the hospitals to see if they can help with funding.  She said this burden on the taxpayer is going to be a lot. 

Councilor Albert mentioned he understood Lisbon Emergency had already reached out to them.  

Roger Voigt said he would like to speak on behalf of the friends at Lisbon Emergency.  He asked everyone to think about their wife, children, and spending $30 more for rent or taxes to save their life.  He said Lisbon Emergency’s rapid response is the only reason he is still here.  

Mike Robitaille pointed out that Lisbon received United Ambulance’s proposal who could not provide in town coverage and that they are owned by the hospital.  He said they are about a 20-30 minutes response from Russell Street in Lewiston. 

Dorothy Fitzgerald said a 30 minutes response is not acceptable when lives are at stake.  

Councilor Albert said Lisbon Emergency is passionate about serving Lisbon residents making sure they are safe because they are not getting rich; we are lucky to have them.

Councilor Larochelle pointed out that on the top of all the surveys previously done, Lisbon residents have always put safety and first responders to take care of loved ones on the top.  He commended those who served on this subcommittee.  He said this was not a short lived process and Council did its due diligence in this process.  He said this has been a process that has been ongoing for a long time.  He encouraged residents to contact the Town Manager or Councilors to get answers to questions.

Councilor Ward said residents didn’t know this may go away by July 1.  He said Lisbon cannot afford to lose anymore “dance partners.”  He said he wanted to do right by those he represents.

Seeing no more comments, the Chairman closed the public hearing.     
AUDIENCE PARTICIPATION & response for agenda items - none
CONSENT AGENDA 

VOTE (2018-15) Councilor Kolbe, seconded by Councilor Lunt moved to approve the Accounts Payable & Payroll Warrants 

A. Municipal Accounts Payable & Payroll Warrants #83 for $10,951.01, #84 for $6,152.27, #85 for $201,014.37, #86 for $17,671.21, #87 for $7,928.56, #88 was added for $541,314.97.
B. School Accounts Payable & Payroll Warrants #1038 for $376,212.14, #1039 for $377,876.24, #1040 for $13,186.35, #20 for $710.18, #1814 for $164,895.67. 
plus the Minutes of January 16, 2018, and to Set a Liquor License & Special Entertainment Public Hearing for Feb 20 for the Flux Restaurant, along with approval and authorization for the Town Manager to sign the Maine Downtown Network’s Annual letter of Agreement.  Order passed - Vote 6-0.
COUNCIL ORDERS, ORDINANCES, & RESOLUTIONS
ASSIGN NANE FOR E911 – BETWEEN 93 AND 109 RIDGE ROAD
INTRODUCTION:  There is a new 20 acre lot located between 93 and 109 Ridge Road.  Because this parcel has more than one buildable lot using the same access from the Ridge Road it is required to have a lane name assigned for addressing purposes.  

Mrs. Barnes indicated the owner, Lou Sullivan, has submitted the name Tepeyac Lane for approval; however, this name does not meet E-911 standards.
VOTE (2018-16) Councilor Albert, seconded by Councilor Kolbe moved to have Lou Sullivan make another recommendation for this Lane.  Order passed - Vote 6-0.
mdot construction overlimit permit 
& Two Party Agreement & THREE PARTY PARTNERSHIP AGREEMENT
INTRODUCTION:  Maine DOT requires a municipality agree to issue a permit, if necessary, for overweight equipment on Town streets pursuant to 29-A MRSA § 2382 for the pavement milling and hot mix overlay located on Route 196: Segment 1 begins at the intersection of Capital Avenue and extends south 1.00 mile to Main Street; Segment 2 begins 0.06 miles South of Bisbee Street and extends South 0.24 of a mile to 0.02 miles South of Frost Hill Avenue.  Project #NHP-2086 (800). This is mandatory, but we do not expect Town streets to be used. If they do need to use them, we can require a bond from the contractor with the permit to insure any damage gets repaired.  
In addition we are requesting permission to sign the attached three party agreement which describe the responsibilities of the Maine DOT, ATRC, and the Town of Lisbon.  Maine DOT will invoice the Town for the Preliminary Engineering and ROW once the Preliminary Design Report is complete.  This project cost is estimated as follows:  

A. Financial Provisions: 
1. The total estimated cost of the Project through all phases is $723,000.00 (the “Project Estimate”), and the Parties agree to share in and allocate the associated costs of each phase as outlined in this section: 
Work Phase 
Estimated

Estimated
Estimated 
Estimated


Federal MPO 
State MPO 
Municipal 
Total Cost

  
Share 

Share

Share

Preliminary Engineering 
$   25,600.00 
$   3,200.00 
$   3,200.00 
$   32,000.00 
Right of Way 
$     8,000.00 
$   1,000.00 
$   1,000.00 
$   10,000.00
Construction 
$ 517,600.00 
$ 64,700.00 
$ 64,700.00 
$ 647,000.00
Construction Engineering 
$   27,200.00 
$   3,400.00 
$   3,400.00 
$   34,000.00  
Total Project Share 
$ 578,400.00 
$ 72,300.00 
$ 72,300.00 
$ 723,000.00  
2. Estimated allocations are further identified as follows: a. Federal share (provided through ATRC Federal Allocation) - 80% of federally participating costs. 

b. State share (provided through ATRC State Allocation) - 10% of federally participating costs. 

c. Municipal share (provided through the Municipality’s obligation of funds) - 10% federally participating costs, plus 100% of all additional work requested by the Municipality. 

And, MDOT requires the municipality approve and sign the Municipal/State Agreement for these proposed projects to Route 196.  This agreement outlines the local and state responsibilities along with the costs estimates and dates when invoices and payments are expected
VOTE (2018-17) Councilor Albert, seconded by Councilor Lunt moved to agree that a construction overlimit permit will be issued to the contractor for the MDOT projects listed above allowing the contractor to haul non-divisible overlimit loads on municipal ways and authorize the Town Manager to establish permit conditions to protect the Town’s interest and to approve and authorize the Town Manager to sign the Two Party Municipal/State Agreement and Third Party Participation Agreement detailing of Maine DOT, ATRC, and municipal responsibilities, as outlined in each document.  Order passed - Vote 6-0.
SCHEDULE SEWER ORDINANCE WORKSHOP

VOTE (2018-18) Councilor Albert, seconded by Councilor Crawford moved to schedule a Sewer Ordinance Workshop for February 13, 2018 at 6:00 pm in the Council’s meeting room.  Order passed - Vote 6-0. 
NATURAL GAS UPGRADES LIBRARY AND FIRE STATION
INTRODUCTION:  Mr. Leighton is requesting the Council give him permission to advertise a RFP to replace the Lisbon Falls Fire Station boiler, upgrade the burner on the Library boiler and hire a contractor to provide excavation support for the extension of the natural gas line from Route 196 along Union Street and Main Street.

Below is the range of estimates received in September 2017.

Library Burner Conversion - $8700 to $11,500

Lisbon Falls Boiler Replacement - $24,000 to $30,000

Excavation Work - $21,000 to $31,000

Total Project Cost Estimate - $54,000 to $73,000

Currently we have designated the following amounts:

Natural Gas Boiler Conversion/Replacement - $23,704

ET Smith Hose Company Floor - $25,000 - Actual Cost $10,965 - Remaining Balance $14,035

Total available designated funds - $37,739

Mr. Leighton mentioned if Lisbon were able to receive similar low bids as we did the first time the funding shortfall expected will be approximately $16,261.  $20,000 was put into the Town Buildings budget to replace heat exchangers at the Town Office in the event of a failure.  Fortunately, we have not had to do any of that work this year and those funds are available to offset the anticipated funding shortfall.  He said at this point he would like to send out the request for bids.
COUNCILOR COMMENTS:  Councilor Larochelle asked what the payback timeframe is for switching over to natural gas.  

Mr. Leighton said he could provide those figures.  He mentioned there was a desire for folks to have this option in this area.  He said he didn’t know for sure what Unitil’s timeframe would be. Those things still need to be ironed out.  He said he would get back to the Council on the payback information.  

Councilor Larochelle agreed that it would be good to put it out to bid. 
VOTE (2018-19) Councilor Larochelle, seconded by Councilor Albert moved authorization to send out the RFP to replace the Lisbon Falls Fire Station boiler, upgrade the burner on the Library boiler and hire a contractor to provide excavation support for the extension of the natural gas line from Route 196 along Union Street and Main Street.  Order passed - Vote 6-0.
DINGLEY TIF – CREDIT ENHANCEMENT AGREEMENT

EXTENSION & SET PUBLIC HEARING DATE
INTRODUCTION:  Dingley Press is requesting the Town of Lisbon grant a five year extension to the current TIF and Credit Enhancement Agreement (CEA) which expires in March 2018.  The original and amended TIF was approved for 25 years. The maximum of a TIF is 30 years; therefore Lisbon may extend the Dingley TIF for five more years.

Dingley is Lisbon’s largest employer and is making a $20,725,000 investment to install a new printing press, co-mailer and other manufacturing process improvements in order to keep up with competition and secure the current workforce of 347 full-time employees.  
Most of the capital investment purchases are BETE assets, which will be a direct return back to the town from the State of Maine in an estimated amount of $230,000 according to the Tax Assessor. For FY2018 the town is scheduled to receive a TIF reimbursement from Dingley in the amount of $163,195.

After the Town Assessor and Economic Development Director met with Dingley on January 30, 2018, timing became important as we move forward because the current TIF and CEA expires this March.  In order to have no gaps in the TIF the State has asked for a quick turnaround in order to meet the March deadline.

The Lisbon Economic & Community Development Department at the request of Dingley Press is recommending Council set a public hearing on Tuesday, March 6, 2018 for the Amended and Restated Dingley Press Municipal Tax Increment Financing (TIF) District and Development Program for another five years.

COUNCILOR COMMENTS:  Councilor Ward asked how many dollars would be shielded in the State Funding for Education calculations. 
James Saffian with Pierce Atwood estimated approximately 40% would be sheltered and/or about $230,000 to $250,000 with a 50/50 split between Dingley Press and the town, making it $120,000 to $125,000 as a rule of thumb.   He said both will benefit from this extension, the town and the business.  If the Council is inclined to go forward with the public hearing then the application needs to go to the state by March 27.  He said they thought the TIF went to June 30, but learned it expires on March 28.  

Ms. Steuber and Neil Poston from Dingley reported this will help keep the over 300 employees here and help Dingley Press be competitive with what’s going on outside. 
VOTE (2018-20) Councilor Larochelle, seconded by Councilor Albert moved to schedule a public hearing on March 6 to discuss the Amended and Restated Dingley Press Municipal TIF Credit District and Development Program for another five years.  Order passed - Vote 6-0.
REPEAL CHAPTER 50 ARTICLE II DIVISION 1
SECTION 50-45 WINTER PARKING  

(First Reading)
INTRODUCTION:  Mrs. Barnes explained the proposed change.  
VOTE (2018-21) Councilor Crawford, seconded by Councilor Kolbe moved to repeal Chapter 50 Article II, Division 1, Section 50-45 as follows: 
Sec. 50-45. - Winter parking between 12:00 midnight and 6:00 a.m. 

The owner or operator of any motor vehicle found parked or left unattended upon any way for a continuous 60-minute period between the hours of 12:00 midnight and 6:00 a.m. of any day during the period from November 1 to April 1 of each year shall, physicians on emergency calls excepted, be punished by a fine as provided in article V of this chapter. 

(Code 1983, § 9-106) 

State Law reference— Snow removal, 29-A M.R.S.A. § 2069. 

Roll Call Vote:  Yeas – Albert, Lunt, Crawford, Larochelle, Ward, and Kolbe.  Nays - None.  Order passed - Vote 6-0.
AMEND CHAPTER 10 ARTICLE IV 
ITINERANT VENDOR ORDINANCE
(First Reading)
INTRODUCTION:  Mrs. Barnes explained the proposed changes.  
VOTE (2018-22) Councilor Albert, seconded by Councilor Kolbe moved to amend Chapter 10, Article IV, Itinerant Vendors Ordinance as follows:
ARTICLE IV. - ITINERANT VENDORS[7] 

Footnotes: 

--- (7) --- 

Cross reference— Streets, sidewalks and other public places, ch. 46. 

State Law reference— Itinerant vendors, 32 M.R.S.A. § 4681 et seq. 

Sec. 10-251. - License required. 

No person shall offer for sale any food, drink or merchandise as an itinerant vendor without first obtaining a license from the town council. Landowners offering space for charge for itinerant vendors must obtain a license for the facility which will cover the facility. This pertains to vehicles, pushcarts, temporary stands or other types of distribution units. Promoters of carnivals, festivals or flea markets shall obtain a license for the event which will cover all vendors. For the purposes of this section, Flea Market shall mean an occasional or periodic market held in an open area or within a structure where property owners offer space for charge to individuals/groups to sell goods for sale to the public and the event is held more than seven (7) days in any twelve-month.
(T.M. of 5-20-1996, art. 18; T.M. of 5-15-2007, § 2007-068; C.M. of 3-1-2016, V. 2016-55) 
Sec. 10-251.5 - Definitions

Itinerant vendor is defined as any person who engages in a temporary business of selling food, drink or merchandise within the Town of Lisbon, other than at the person’s permanent place of business or place of legal voting residence. 

Flea market is defined as an occasional or periodic market held in an open area or within a structure where property owners offer space for charge to individuals/groups to sell goods for sale to the public and the event is held more than seven (7) days in any twelve-month period. 

Sec. 10-252. - Police department review. 

Before receiving a license, the police department will certify that the vendor will not create safety problems for  either traffic or pedestrians and that information on file does not indicate that the applicant is a person of bad moral character. 

(T.M. of 5-20-1996, art. 18) Sec. 10-253. - Term of license; fee. 

(a)  Every license issued under this article shall be issued only for the following terms, subject to the corresponding fee. 

Application fees shall be: 

	Temporary stands (90 days or less)
	$75.00

	6 months itinerant vendor 
	$150.00 100.00

	12 months itinerant vendor 
	$200 150.00

	1 week carnivals and festivals 
	200.00 

	12-month outdoor flea market 
	100.00 

	12-month indoor flea market 
	200.00 

	Public records checks 
	50.00 

	Junkyard license
	100.00


 

(b)  Municipal organizations or agencies are exempt from fees in this section. 

(c)  The town Ccouncil may waive fees for charitable and non-profit organizations registered with the Secretary of State and in compliance with the Internal Revenue Service Code Section 501. 

(T.M. of 5-20-1996, art. 18; Sel. Ord. of 2-18-2003, § 5.158; Sel. Ord. of 6-21-05, § 5.016; C.M. of 7-1-2014, V. 2014-118; C.M. of 7-7-2015, V. 2015-192; C.M. of 3-1-2016, V. 2016-55) 
Sec. 10-254. - Food. 

Any vendor serving food shall be considered a victualer and shall be licensed under, and comply with, the provisions of Article V, Victualers. 

(T.M. of 5-20-1996, art. 18; T.M. of 11-3-2005, art. 8) 
Sec. 10-255. - Revocation of license. 

Any license issued under this article may be revoked by the town council after notice and hearing as provided in 30-A M.R.S.A. § 3814. 

(T.M. of 5-20-1996, art. 18; T.M. of 5-15-2007, § 2007-068) 
Sec. 10-256. - Location. 

(a)  No itinerant vendor may occupy an area larger than 144 square feet. The town council may, after public hearing, allow for a larger area to be occupied provided the vendor is located in a private lot and within a zone allowing the proposed use. No vendor may operate within 200 feet, measured by a direct line, of any establishment doing business at a fixed location, which sells the same or similar food or merchandise being sold by the vendor. In addition, no vendor may operate within 100 feet, measured by a direct line, of any other vendor who sells the same or similar food or merchandise. Vendors authorized to participate in carnivals, festivals, mass gatherings or flea markets shall be exempt from this section. 

(b)  A full description of the location where the peddling is to be carried out and a letter of agreement from the owner of record of the property where the applicant will be located shall be submitted. 

(T.M. of 5-20-1996, art. 18; T.M. of 9-5-2006, § 2006-28) 
Sec. 10-257. - Sanitation. 

Each vendor shall provide waste receptacles for the use of customers, shall keep the immediate area free of litter, and will provide for the disposal of such waste. 

(T.M. of 5-20-1996, art. 18) 
Sec. 10-258. - Public hearing. 

The initial license under this article shall be issued by the town council after public hearing. The town council may delegate authority to the clerk to issue temporary licenses after meeting all requirements prior to a public hearing. Renewal licenses may be issued by the town council without subsequent public hearing, except that the town council shall have the authority to require a public hearing at the request of the applicant or in circumstances where the town council feels a public hearing would produce information relevant to the license renewal. 

(T.M. of 5-20-1996, art. 18; T.M. of 5-15-2007, § 2007-068) 
Sec. 10-259. - Amendments. 

The town council shall have the further power to adjust the fees and license requirements of this article as appropriate after public hearing. 

(T.M. of 5-20-1996, art. 18; T.M. of 5-15-2007, § 2007-068) 

Sec. 10-260. – Violation; penalties.

In addition to revocation or suspension of an itinerant vendor’s license as provided in section 10-255, the violation of any provision of this article shall be punished by a fine of not less than $250.00 nor more than $1500.00 for each offense, plus costs of prosecution including but not limited to attorney’s fees. Each act of violation and every day upon which any such violation shall occur shall constitute a separate offense. Any violation of this article or of any condition or requirement adopted pursuant to these provisions may be restrained, corrected, or abated, as the case may be, by injunction or other appropriate proceedings as allowed by state law. All fines and penalties, together with costs of prosecution of violations, shall be recovered for the benefit of the town. 

Sec. 10-261. - Enforcement. 

This article shall be enforced by the Lisbon Police Chief, the Lisbon Codes Enforcement Officer, their designees, or other appropriate staff member, including legal counsel, for the town. Notice of violations by itinerant vendors of other provisions of the Lisbon Code of Ordinances shall be provided to the police chief, town council, and town attorney. 

Secs. 10-260 260—10-290. - Reserved. 

Roll Call Vote:  Yeas – Albert, Lunt, Crawford, Larochelle, Ward, and Kolbe.  Nays - None.  Order passed - Vote 6-0.

Administrative                         AMEND CHAPTER 50 54 BUILDINGS AND BUILDING REGULATIONS 
corr 2/22/18 TL                                                                  (First Reading)
Chapter 50 s/b 54
INTRODUCTION:  Mrs. Barnes explained the proposed changes.  
VOTE (2018-23) Councilor Larochelle, seconded by Councilor Kolbe moved to amend Chapter 50 54 Buildings and Building Regulations as follows:  

Chapter 54 - BUILDINGS AND BUILDING REGULATIONS[1] 

Footnotes: 

--- (1) --- 

Cross reference— Manufactured housing, mobile homes and trailers, ch. 22; sanitary sewers, ch. 34; solid waste transfer and recycling, ch. 38; streets, sidewalks and other public places, ch. 46; floods, ch. 58; site plans, ch. 62; subdivisions, ch. 66; zoning, ch. 70, town council rules, regulations and policies for sanitary sewers, ch. 94; town council rules, regulations and policies for solid waste transfer and recycling, ch. 98. 

State Law reference— Authority to adopt technical codes by reference, etc., 30-A M.R.S.A. § 3003; board of appeals, 30-A M.R.S.A. § 2691. 
ARTICLE I. - IN GENERAL 

Secs. 54-1—54-30. - Reserved. 
ARTICLE II. - BUILDING CODE[2] 

Footnotes: 

--- (2) --- 

Editor's note— At a special town meeting of Nov. 3, 2005, art. 7, amended Art. II in its entirety to read as herein set out. Former Art. II, §§ 54-31—54-34, pertained to similar subject, and derived from Code 1983, §§ 4-101—4-103; T.M. of May 13, 1995, art. 61, §§ 4-101, 4-103; T.M. of May 15, 1999, art. 59, §§ 4-103, 4-104. 

State Law reference— Authority to adopt building code by reference, 30-A M.R.S.A. § 3003; regulation of buildings, 30-A M.R.S.A. § 4101 et seq., Definitions, 10 M.R.S.A. § 9721, Technical Building Codes and Standards Board, 10 M.R.S.A. § 9722.
Sec. 54-31. - Adoption. 

In accordance with 30-A M.R.S.A. § 3003, as the same may be amended from time to time, the Maine Uniform Building and Energy Code and its regulated elements the International Building Code 2003 and the International Residential Code 2003, both published by the International Code Council, Inc., are hereby adopted and incorporated by reference herein, except for such portions as are deleted, modified, or amended in this article, as the minimum standards for the construction, alteration, addition, repair, removal, demolition, use, location, occupancy and maintenance of all buildings and structures, both existing and proposed, located within the Town of Lisbon. 

(T.M. of 11-3-2005, art. 7) 
Sec. 54-32. - Definitions and general provisions. 

The International Building Code and the International Residential Code shall be construed as follows: 

(1)  Name of jurisdiction. Wherever the phrase "name of jurisdiction" appears in the code, "the Town of Lisbon" shall be substituted. 

(2)  Name of state . Wherever the phrase "name of the state" appears in the code, "the State of Maine" shall be substituted. 

(3)  Department of building safety . Wherever the term "department of building safety" appears "the codes enforcement office" shall be substituted. 

(4)  Building official . Wherever the term "building official" appears in the code, it shall mean the building inspector of the town or his duly authorized representative. 

(5)  Electrical Code . Wherever the term "ICC Electrical Code" appears in the code, it shall mean the National Electrical Code as adopted by Town of Lisbon. 

(6)  Fire Code . Wherever the term "International Fire Prevention Code" appears in the code, it shall mean the NFPA Code as adopted by the Town of Lisbon. 

(7)  Gas Code . Wherever the term "International Fuel Gas Code" appears in the code, it shall mean the NFPA Code as adopted by the Town of Lisbon. 

(8)  Plumbing Code . Wherever the "International Plumbing Code" appears in the code, it shall mean the State of Maine Plumbing Code. 

(9)  Other regulations . Wherever the codes refer to "other regulations," "all pertinent laws," or "other provisions of law," such references shall include, at a minimum, the Maine Revised Statutes Annotated, the Private and Special Laws of the State of Maine, regulations of administrative agencies of the State of Maine, other provisions of the code except those deleted, and all of the ordinances of the town. 

(T.M. of 11-3-2005, art. 7) 
Sec. 54-33. - Additions, deletions, insertions and changes to the ICC International Building Code (2003). 

The ICC International Building Code (2003) is revised as follows: 

Section 101.4 Referenced codes , is amended by adding the following language after the words "each such reference"; "any reference to the ICC Electrical Code, International Fuel Gas Code, International Plumbing Code and International Fire Prevention Code, found in any and all locations in this code, shall be stricken and replaced with the referenced standards described in sections 101.4.1 through and including 101.4.6." 

Section 101.4.1 Electrical , is amended by deleting the words "ICC Electrical Code" and adding, the words "the National Electrical Code as adopted by the Town of Lisbon." 

Section 101.4.2 Gas , is amended by deleting the words "International Fuel Gas Code" and adding the words "the NFPA Code as adopted by the Town of Lisbon." 

Section 101.4.4 Plumbing , is amended by deleting the words "International Plumbing Code", and adding the words "the State of Maine Plumbing Code"; and striking the words "the International Private Sewage Disposal Code" and adding the words "Maine Subsurface Waste Water Disposal Rules." 

Section 101.4.5 Property maintenance, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 101.4.6 Fire prevention, is amended by deleting the words "International Fire Prevention Code" and adding the words "the NFPA Code as adopted by the Town of Lisbon." 

Section 102.4 Referenced codes and standards, is amended by deleting the words "of this Code shall apply" in the last sentence and adding the words "the more restrictive codes shall apply." 

Section 102.6 Existing structures, is amended by deleting the words "the International Property Maintenance Code or the International Fire Code" and adding the words "the Minimum Standards for Housing and the NFPA Code as adopted by the Town of Lisbon." and by adding the words "and/or the Fire Chief" after the words "building official." 

Section 103 Department of Building Safety, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 105.1.1, Annual permit, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 105.1.2, Annual permit records, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 105.2(1), is amended by adding the following at the end of the section "Building permits are required for storage sheds that do not exceed ____________ sq. ft. These structures are exempt for building code standards but must be reviewed for zoning compliance." 

Section 105.2(2), is amended by deleting the words "not over 6 feet (1829 mm) high." 

Section 105.2(6), is amended by deleting the words "not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above grade and not over any basement or story below grade and which is not part of an accessible route." 

Section 105.2 Electrical, gas and plumbing (work exempt from permits), is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 107.3 Temporary power, is amended by deleting the words "ICC Electrical Code" and substituting therefore "the National Electrical Code as adopted by the Town of Lisbon." 

Section 108.2 Schedule of permit fees, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 110.0 Certificate of occupancy, is amended by addition of a new subsection (5): 

"Section 110.5 Issuance of certificate : No certificate of occupancy nor temporary certificate of occupancy shall be issued under the provisions of this code where any condition of the building or the property is not in compliance with any other section of the Lisbon Town Code or applicable ordinances." 

Section 111, Service Utilities, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 112.0 Board of Appeals, is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following language: 

(1)  Any person, firm or corporation aggrieved by a decision of the building official may appeal to the board of appeals as established under section 70-121 of the Lisbon Zoning Ordinance. 

(2)  Procedure: 

(a)  All appeals shall be based on a written decision of the building official. 

(b)  An appeal may be taken within 30 days from the date that the decision appealed from is made by filing a notice of appeal with the building official and paying a filing fee of $20.00. The notice of appeal shall state the ground for appeal and shall be accompanied by such information as may be required for a clear understanding of the case. 

(c)  The board of appeals after a public hearing of which the applicant shall have not less than seven days' notice shall affirm or reverse the decision of the building inspector or may vary the application of any provision of this code in any particular case when, in its opinion, the enforcement thereof would do manifest injustice and would be contrary to the spirit and purpose of this code. 

(d)  A decision of the board of appeals to vary the application of any provision of this code or to modify an order of the building inspector shall set forth the nature of the variation, the conditions, if any, upon which it is made, and the reasons therefor. 

(e)  The board of appeals shall, in every case, reach a decision without unnecessary delay. Every decision of the board of appeals shall be promptly filed in the office of the building inspector. A copy shall be sent by mail or otherwise delivered to the person filing the appeal. 

(f)  If a decision of the board of appeals reverses or modifies the action of the building inspector or varies the application of any provision of this code, the building inspector shall take action promptly in accordance with such decision. 

(g)  A person aggrieved by a decision of the board of appeals may, within 30 days after the filing of such decision in the office of the building inspector, appeal to the superior court in accordance with rule 80(B) of the Maine Rules of Civil Procedure." 

Section 113.4 Violation penalties, is deleted and replaced with the following: 

"Any person, firm or corporation who violates any of the provisions of this code or fails to comply with any standards for performance set forth herein, or who violates or fails to comply with any lawful order made pursuant hereto, or who builds inconsistently with any statement of specifications or plans submitted and approved hereunder or in violation of any certificate or permit in force hereunder, shall be punished jointly and severally for each and every violation by a penalty of not less than $50.00 and not more than $500.00. Any owner of a building or structure or portion thereof, or of any premises where a violation of this code shall exist, or any other person employed in construction or in any other activity resulting in such violation who knowingly assists in committing the same shall be punished by a fine of not more than $100.00. A separate offense shall be deemed committed upon each day during or on which prohibited conditions are maintained or a violation occurs or continues. 

Section 114.3 Unlawful continuance, is amended by deleting the words "shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law"; and by adding the following language at the end of the subsection "shall be subject to action pursuant to Section 113.3 and penalties pursuant to Section 113.4." 

Section 501.1 Scope, is amended by adding the following sentence at the end of the subsection: 

"To the extent the provisions of this Chapter are inconsistent with the provisions of Article ____________ of the Town of Lisbon Code, the Town of Lisbon Code shall control." 

Section 2111 Masonry Fireplaces, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 2112 Masonry Heaters, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 2113 Masonry Chimneys, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 2611 Light-Transmitting Plastic Interior Signs, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 3109 Swimming Pool Enclosures and Safety Devices, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 3309 Fire Extinguishers, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 3312 Automatic Sprinkler System, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 3404 Fire Escapes, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 3409 Accessibility for Existing Buildings, is deleted in its entirety. 

The following chapters of the ICC International Building Code (2003 edition) will be deleted in their entirety: 

"Chapter 7 - Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction" 

"Chapter 9 - Fire Protection Systems" 

"Chapter 11 - Accessibility" 

"Chapter 13 - Energy Efficiency" 

"Chapter 27 - Electric Wiring, Equipment and Systems" 

"Chapter 28 - Mechanical Systems" 

"Chapter 29 - Plumbing Systems" 

"Chapter 30 - Elevators and Conveying Systems" 

"Chapter 32 - Encroachments into the Public Right-Of-Way" 
"Appendix A - Employee Qualifications" 

"Appendix B - Board of Appeals" 

"Appendix D - Fire Districts" 

"Appendix E - Supplementary Accessibility Requirements" 

(T.M. of 11-3-2005, art. 7) 
Sec. 54-34. - Additions, deletions, insertions and changes to the ICC International Residential Code (2003). 

The International Residential Code (2003 Edition) is amended as follows: 

Section (EB)R102.7 Existing structures, is amended by deleting the words "the International Property Maintenance Code or the International Fire Code" and inserting "the Minimum Standards for Housing and the NFPA Code as adopted by the Town of Lisbon." 

Section R103 Department of Building Safety is deleted in its entirety. 

Section R105.2(1) is amended by adding the following at the end of the section "Building permits are required for storage sheds that do not exceed ____________ sq. ft. These structures are exempt for building code standards but must be reviewed for zoning compliance." 

Section R105.2(6) is amended by deleting the language "not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above grade and not over any story below grade and which is not part of an accessible route." 

Section R105.2 Electrical, plumbing and Gas is deleted in its entirety. 

Section R105.3.1.1 Substantially improved or substantially damaged existing structures in areas prone to flooding, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section R106.1 Information for construction in areas prone to flooding, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section R108.0 Fees, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section R109.1.1 Footing/Building Location and Foundation Inspection, is amended by adding the following language before the words "Inspection of the foundation": "Inspection for the building location, relative to the approved site or plot plan, shall be made after the construction area is excavated and any required forms are erected and any required reinforcing steel is in place, and prior to the placing of concrete. All property lines shall be identified for the purpose of determining zoning district setback compliance." 

Section 111, Service Utilities, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section R112.0 Board of Appeals, is hereby repealed and replaced with the following language: "Appeals shall be conducted in accordance with Section 112 of the ICC International Building Code (2003 edition) as adopted for use by the Town of Lisbon." 

Section 113.4 Violation penalties is repealed and replaced with the following: 

"Any person, firm or corporation who violates any of the provisions of this code or fails to comply with any standards for performance set forth herein, or who violates or fails to comply with any lawful order made pursuant hereto, or who builds inconsistently with any statement of specifications or plans submitted and approved hereunder or in violation of any certificate or permit in force hereunder, shall be punished jointly and severally for each and every violation by a penalty of not less than $50.00 and not more than $500.00. Any owner of a building or structure or portion thereof, or of any premises where a violation of this code shall exist, or any other person employed in construction or in any other activity resulting in such violation who knowingly assists in committing the same shall be punished by a fine of not more than $100.00. A separate offense shall be deemed committed upon each day during or on which prohibited conditions are maintained or a violation occurs or continues." 
Section 114.2 Unlawful continuance, is amended by deleting the words "shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law"; and by adding the following language at the end of the subsection "shall be subject to action pursuant to Section 113.3 and penalties pursuant to Section 113.4." 

Section R302 Location on Lot, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section R307 Toilet, Bath and Shower Spaces, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section R309.2 Separation required, is amended by adding the phrase: "All penetrations shall be protected in accordance with Section 317.3.1.2 of the International Residential Code." 

Section R310.1.1 Minimum opening area, is amended by deleting the following exception: "Exception: Grade floor openings shall have a minimum not clear opening of 5 square feet (0.465 m2)." 

Section R311.4.3 Landing at doors, is amended by adding the following exception: "Exception: A landing is not required at the top of a flight of stairs, provided the door does not swing over the stairs." 

Section R313 Smoke Alarms, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section R315 Flame Spread and Smoke Density, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section R323 Flood Resistant Construction, is deleted in its entirety. 

The following chapters are deleted in their entirety: 

"Chapter 10 - Chimneys and Fireplaces" 

"Chapter 11 - Energy Efficiency" 

"Chapter 12 - Mechanical Administration" 

"Chapter 13 - General Mechanical System Requirements" 

"Chapter 14 - Heating and Cooling Equipment" 

"Chapter 15 - Exhaust Systems" 

"Chapter 16 - Duct Systems" 

"Chapter 17 - Combustion Air" 

"Chapter 18 - Chimneys and Vents" 

"Chapter 19 - Special Fuel-Burning Equipment" 

"Chapter 20 - Boilers/Water Heaters" 

"Chapter 21 - Hydronic Piping" 

"Chapter 22 - Special Piping and Storage Systems" 

"Chapter 23 - Solar Systems" 

"Chapter 24 - Fuel Gas" 

"Chapter 25 - Plumbing Administration" 

"Chapter 26 - General Plumbing Requirements" 

"Chapter 27 - Plumbing Fixtures" 

"Chapter 28 - Water Heaters" 

"Chapter 31 - Vents" 

"Chapter 32 - Traps" 

"Chapter 33 - General Requirements" 

"Chapter 34 - Electrical Definitions" 

"Chapter 35 - Services" 

"Chapter 36 - Branch Circuit and Feeder Requirements" 

"Chapter 37 - Wiring Methods" 

"Chapter 38 - Power Lighting and Distribution" 

"Chapter 39 - Devices and Luminaires" 

"Chapter 40 - Appliance Installation" 

"Chapter 41 - Swimming Pools" 

"Chapter 42 - Class 2 Remote-Control, Signaling and Power-Limited Circuits" 

"Appendix A" 

"Appendix B" 

"Appendix C" 

"Appendix D" 

"Appendix I" 

"Appendix K" 

"Appendix L" 

(T.M. of 11-3-2005, art. 7) 
Sec. 54-35. - Standards mandatory. 

Except as otherwise expressly provided, all general provisions of this article and the codes incorporated herein are mandatory. Exceptions to general prohibitions or requirements shall be narrowly construed and narrowly applied. Any person asserting that failure to comply with a general prohibition or requirement is authorized by an exception to such general prohibition or requirement shall bear the burden of proof as to such exception. 

(T.M. of 11-3-2005, art. 7) 
Sec. 54-36. - Other code and statutory provisions. 

Where any other provisions of this Code contain more stringent requirements, compliance with the more stringent requirements shall be required. Where approval of the fire chief, or any other specified town official is required by any provision of this Code as to the subject matter of the permit application, such approval shall be a condition precedent to issuance of the permit under this article. Whenever there is an application for a permit for any structure, other than a single or two-family dwelling, such permit shall not be issued without the written certificate of the fire chief or his authorized representative that the work described is in compliance with other requirement of this Code or of state law as to fire prevention or exiting. 

(T.M. of 11-3-2005, art. 7)
Sec. 54-37. - Violations. 

Violations of the applicable provisions of either the ICC Building Code or the ICC Residential Code shall be subject to the penalty provisions of section. Violation of any provision of this article shall constitute a civil violation punishable by a fine not exceeding $100.00 for each offense. Each day that a violation continues shall be treated as a separate offense. All fines collected shall inure to the town.
(T.M. of 11-3-2005, art. 7) 
Sec. 54-38. - Municipal plumbing inspection and permit fees. 

In addition to all other fees hereunder or under any state law, the town shall charge a $10.00 base fee for plumbing inspections and the following Ffees are established for plumbing permits in accordance with the Maine State Plumbing/Subsurface Wastewater Disposal System Permit Fee Schedule.

(T.M. of 11-3-2005, art. 7) 

Secs. 54-39—54-70. - Reserved. 
Roll Call Vote:  Yeas – Albert, Lunt, Crawford, Larochelle, Ward, and Kolbe.  Nays - None.  Order passed - Vote 6-0.
AMEND CHAPTER 30 ARTICLE III PARK REGULATIONS
SECTION 88-5 SPECIAL REGULATIONS
(First Reading)
INTRODUCTION:  Mrs. Barnes explained the proposed change adding the section covering private events or private gatherings sponsored by an individual person or persons, such as a wedding, in which alcohol is served by a licensed establishment with an off-premise catering license under Title 28-A M.R.S.A. § 1052.  Plus the section adding that the Town Council may require, as a condition of allowing alcohol at a gathering or event under this section, that a police officer be present at the expense of the applicant.  
COUNCILOR COMMENTS:  Councilor Crawford said he would like to see either a security officer or police officer instead of just a police officer for cases where the group could provide their own at their expense.  
VOTE (2018-24) Councilor Crawford, seconded by Councilor Lunt moved to adopt the amendment to Chapter 30, Article III, Section 88.5 as presented and to insert security officer as follows: 
Sec. 30-88.5. - Special regulations. 

(a)  Use of parks, gardens and trails for events requires a permit. Permit applications are available at the town clerk's office. 

(b)  Smoking is not allowed in any park. 

(c)  Alcohol possession or use is not allowed in any park. Any exception to this rule must be approved in advance by the town council and shall be limited to:

(1)  special public events or public gatherings sponsored by a charitable, nonprofit organization or civic group in which alcohol is served by a licensed establishment with an off-premise catering license under Title 28-A M.R.S.A. § 1052. 

(2)  private events or private gatherings sponsored by an individual person or persons, such as a wedding, in which alcohol is served by a licensed establishment with an off-premise catering license under Title 28-A M.R.S.A. § 1052.

The Town Council may require, as a condition of allowing alcohol at a gathering or event under this section, that a security officer or police officer be present at the expense of the applicant.  
(d)  Dogs are allowed in parks but only on a leash as per section 6-31 and waste removal is required as per section 6-34. 

(e)  No sign advertising any business or commercial enterprise or activity or any political sign, shall be allowed on park, garden or trail property. Signs for a limited time and for a limited purpose of advertising community events or events sponsored by non-profit agencies may be permitted with the issuance of a permit as provided under section 91-36. 

(f)  No peddling, soliciting or commercial enterprise is permitted to conduct business on Beaver Park property. 

(g)  Metal detectors are prohibited on Beaver Park property. 

(T.M. of 12-9-2003, art. 5; T.M. of 10-16-2007, § 2007-165A; C.M. of 10-7-2014, V. 2014-202; C.M. of 3-1-2016, V. 2016-56 ) 

Roll Call Vote:  Yeas – Albert, Lunt, Crawford, Larochelle, Ward, and Kolbe.  Nays - None.  Order passed - Vote 6-0.
AMEND CHAPTER 46 ARTICLE VI STREET LIGHTING 

SECTION 46-147 SUBSECTION 1
(First Reading)
INTRODUCTION:  Mrs. Barnes explained the proposed change.  

VOTE (2018-25) Councilor Crawford, seconded by Councilor Albert moved to amend Chapter 46 Article VI Street Lighting Section 46-147 Subsection 1 as follows: 
Sec. 46-147. - Street light placement standards. 

Street light placement within public right-of-ways shall conform to the following standards as feasible given utility pole spacing and light pole spacing: 

(1)  Village zone. For any roadway within the Village Area Zone indicated on the street light service map in appendix B*: 

a. One streetlight shall be located at all roadway intersections and mid-block locations at a spacing interval of approximately 220 feet as feasible given existing utility pole and light pole spacing. 

b. Street segments less than 350 feet in length shall only be lit at roadway intersections and dead ends. 

c. Ornamental and streetscape lighting may be used to light roadways where sidewalks are present and highlight public building facades and public areas as determined. Ornamental lighting currently serves to light the public right-of-way for portions of Main Street, Village Street, Webster Street, and a short distance of Route 196 (Lisbon Street). If ornamental lighting is the standard than then all other lighting will be removed from poles unless it is determined by the town engineer, public safety (police, fire) and public works department determine the need exists.

d. There are many varied potential street lighting needs to be served in the Village Zone because it encompasses the most diverse areas of town in building style, density, setback variances and public infrastructure availability.  If recommended by the planning board and approved by the town council, the town may accept a street lighting plan in the Village Zone that is not consistent with all standards in this article if the street lighting plan meets the overall intent of this article, seeks to maintain public safety and will provide an economic and aesthetic benefit to the town beyond its cost for maintenance.    

Roll Call Vote:  Yeas – Albert, Lunt, Crawford, Larochelle, Ward, and Kolbe.  Nays - None.  Order passed - Vote 6-0.
LISBON EMERGENCY – LEVEL OF SERVICE & FUNDING
COUNCILOR COMMENTS:  Councilor Albert said he was ready to act, that he was confident the Council has a clear picture.  Councilor Lunt said he was ready to direct the Town Manager to come up with an actual plan and budget.  Councilor Crawford asked about the replacement ambulance planned in two years.  Jim McDonnell said the proposed numbers included the replacement and that there were no other obligations.    
VOTE (2018-26) Councilor Larochelle, seconded by Councilor Albert moved to direct the Town Manager to work with Lisbon Emergency to put together a budget for the coming year.  Order passed - Vote 6-0.
OTHER business 
A. COUNCIL COMMITTEE REPORTS

1. School: Councilor Albert reported the School Committee is working on their budget.
2. Planning:  Councilor Ward said a site visit was cancelled.  The current application is pending waiting for the applicant to decide whether or not they are planning on another location.  The Comprehensive Plan survey is out.
3. Water Commission: Councilor Brunelle was absent.
4. LDC: Councilor Larochelle reported there is a meeting next week to discuss goals.
5. Conservation Commission:  Councilor Ward said this will come up later on the agenda.
6. Recreation:  Councilor Kolbe asked Mr. Stevens to report.  Mr. Stevens said they met to discuss goals, programs, and the facility’s needs. They review Winterfest and the current budget. 
7. County Budget:  Councilor Ward- Nothing to report.

8. Library: Councilor Lunt- Nothing to report.

B. TOWN MANAGER’S REPORT
Mrs. Barnes said she had nothing to report.
C. CONSERVATION COMMISSION REPORT
Annica McGuirk and Richard Main gave a brief presentation.  They talked about invasive plants in Lisbon and the damage that they can do.  Mr. Main pointed out there are two Norway Maple trees in Gazebo Park.  The Norway Maple kills the grass under the tree canopy, along with killing Sugar Maples and Red Maples.  

Councilor Larochelle said it would be nice to look at all of our town properties to see what’s there.   

Mr. Stevens said the 2011 Forestry Management Plan will be reviewed, also.  
APPOINTMENTS – NONE
councilor COMMUNICATIONS

Councilor Lunt asked resident to stay off the road during the upcoming storm.  He thanked the Public Works crew in advance for the long hours ahead of them.
AUDIENCE PARTICIPATION FOR NEW ITEMS
Ms. Steuber asked the Council for direction on what the Dingley TIF agreement would provide for, ECD
Funding or infrastructure projects.  Councilor Larochelle suggested it remain the same for now and do an amendment later.  Ms. Steuber reported the decision needed to be done prior to the hearing.  Mrs. Barnes recommended she and Ms. Steuber come back with a couple of recommendations for next Tuesday’s workshop which would be prior to the public hearing.  

EXECUTIVE SESSION
VOTE (2018-27, 28, & 29) Councilor Kolbe, seconded by Councilor Lunt moved to go into Executive Session at 8:32 PM per 1 MRSA Section 405 (6) (E) Consultations with Legal Counsel, Section 405 (6) (D) Labor Negotiations,  and 405 (6) (A) Personnel Matters.  Order passed – Vote 6-0.
The Council came out of executive session at 9:50 PM and the meeting resumed.  
VOTE (2018-28A) Councilor Larochelle, seconded by Councilor Crawford moved that a tentative agreement with the Sergeant’s bargaining unit for a 3-year contract is ratified.   Order passed - Vote 6-0.
adjoURNMENT
VOTE (2018-30) Councilor Kolbe, seconded by Councilor Albert moved to adjourn at 9:50 PM.  Order passed - Vote 6-0.
__________________________________

Twila D. Lycette, Council Secretary

Town Clerk, Lifetime CCM/MMC

Date Approved February 20, 2018
Fern Larochelle, At Large 2020 


 Normand Albert, At Large 2018 


Kasie Kolbe, District 1 2018


Allen Ward, District 2 2018


Christopher Brunelle, At Large 2019


Mark Lunt, District 1 2019


Kris Crawford, District 2, 2019












